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► Anthropology 
  

❖ Publication 
 
• Prof. Dr. Egemen YILGÜR's article titled "Formel, Enformel ve Geleneksel Mahalle 

Deneyimi Üzerine Düşünceler" was published in Varlık journal. 
 

❖ Guest Speaker 
 

• Asst. Prof. Ayşe Hilal Tuztaş HORZUMLU participated as a guest speaker on the 
Memleket Sohbetleri program at TRT Istanbul Radio (April 21). 
 

❖ Jury Membership 
 
• Prof. Ebru KAYAALP participated in the master’s thesis defense of Selda Sevencan as a 

jury member, at the Department of Anthropology at Yeditepe University, on April  22. 
 

• Asst. Prof. Ayşe Hilal Tuztaş HORZUMLU participated in the master’s thesis defense of 
Selda Sevencan as a jury member, at the Department of Anthropology at Yeditepe 
University, on April  22. 
 

 
❖  Other 

 
• Prof. Ebru KAYAALP has attended as a panelist in the evaluation of the project proposal 

submitted to SOBAG - Social and Human Sciences Research Support Group within the 
scope of TÜBİTAK 3501 - Career Development Program on April 2. 

 
•  Prof. Ebru KAYAALP has participated as an external consultant in the evaluation of the 

project proposal submitted to TÜBİTAK SOBAG - Social and Human Sciences Research 
Support Group on April 5. 

 



 

► Philosophy 
 

❖  Guest Speaker 
 

• Asst. Prof. Levent Yurdakul KAVAS delivered a virtual presentation titled "Aralık 
Nedir" as part of Ulus Baker Okumaları 51’ on April 19. 

 
❖ Publication 

 
• Asst. Prof. Levent Yurdakul KAVAS’ article titled "Blanco/Ak İçin Dar Bir Çerçeve?" 

was published in Doğu Batı. 
 
 

► Physics 
 

❖ Publication 
 

• The article titled "Measurement and interpretation of same-sign $W$ boson pair production 
in association with two jets in $pp$ collisions at $\sqrt{s} = $13 TeV with the ATLAS 
detector," co-authored by Asst. Prof. Serhat IŞTIN as part of The ATLAS Collaboration, 
has been published in Journal of High Energy Physics (JHEP). 

 
• The article titled "Software Performance of the ATLAS Track Reconstruction for LHC Run 

3," co-authored by Asst. Prof. Serhat IŞTIN as part of the ATLAS Collaboration, has been 
published in Computing and Software for Big Science. 

 
• The article titled "Search for new phenomena with top-quark pairs and large missing 

transverse momentum using 140 fb^{-1} of $pp$ collision data at $\sqrt{s}=13$ TeV with 
the ATLAS detector," co-authored by Asst. Prof. Serhat IŞTIN as part of the ATLAS 
Collaboration, has been published in Journal of High Energy Physics (JHEP). 

 
• The article titled "Study of high-momentum Higgs boson production in association with a 

vector boson in the qq bb final state with the ATLAS detector," co-authored by Asst. Prof. 
Serhat IŞTIN as part of the ATLAS Collaboration, has been published in Physical Review 
Letters. 

 
• The article titled "Measurement of the transverse momentum and rapidity distributions of 

the boson at 8 TeV with the ATLAS detector," co-authored by Asst. Prof. Serhat IŞTIN as 
part of the ATLAS Collaboration, has been published in European Physical Journal C. 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 

► English Language and Literature 
 

❖ Conference Participation 
 

• Prof. Adriana RADUCANU presented a paper titled “Crimson Chronicles: Probing Illness 
and Politics in Dan Simmons' Children of the Night” at the 33rd British and American 
Studies Conference (April 25-27). 

 
• Assoc. Prof. Catherine MACMILLAN presented a paper titled “Something's Burning 

(Out) in Monica Ali's 'In the Kitchen'” at the 33rd British and American Studies Conference 
(April 25-27). 
 
 

► Mathematics 
               

❖ Publication 
 

• The article titled "Isometries of length 1 in purely loxodromic free Kleinian groups and 
trace inequalities" by Asst. Prof. İlker Savaş YÜCE has been published in the Turkish 
Journal of Mathematics. 

 
❖ Workshop Participation 

 
• Asst. Prof. Mehmet Akif ERDAL virtually presented a paper titled “Königsberg’in Yedi 

Köprüsü ve Euler Karakteristiği” at the 4. Topoloji Çalıştayı (April 27). 
 

❖ Symposium Participation 
 

• Res. Asst. Esra BAŞAR presented a paper titled "Rotundity of Orlicz Spaces" at 
Harmonic Analysis and Distributions (HANDS'24) (April 10). 

 
❖ Jury Membership 

 
• Prof. Mustafa POLAT served as a jury member on the thesis monitoring committee at the 

Faculty of Science, Department of Mathematics, Marmara University (April 3, 2024). 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

► Psychology 
 

❖  Book 
 
• Assoc. Prof. Neslihan ZABCI's chapter titled "Makara Oyunu, Yineleme Zorlantısı ve 

Egemen Olma Dürtüsü " is featured in the book titled "Fred Diye Diye" published by 
Sanat Kritik Publishing. 

 
• Asst. Prof. Billur ÖRNEK’s chapter titled "Bağlanma Kuramı" is featured in the book 

titled " Kişilik Kuramları: Örnek Vaka Çözümleri" published by Nobel Publishing. 
 
 

► Sociology 
 

❖ Conference Participation 
 

• Asst. Prof. Çağrı İDİMAN presented a paper titled “Venetian Food-Regime and the 
Origins of Capitalist Agriculture” at the Historical Materialism Istanbul Conference 2024 
(April 5-7). 

 
 

► History 
 
❖ Congress Participation 

 
• Prof. Dr. Ahmet TAŞAĞIL presented the paper titled "On the Roles of Töles (T’ie-le) 

Tribes in Central Asia between VI-VII Centuries" at the International Conference History 
and Culture of Peoples Steppe Eurasia (April 1-2) 

 
 

► Turkish Language and Literature 
 

❖ Book 
 
• The book "Erkeksiz Kadınlar," edited by Prof. Dr. Mehmet KANAR, has been published 

by Can Publishing (ISBN: 978-975-07-6320-5) 
 

❖ Guest Speaker 
 

• Prof. Melda ÜNER gave a talk titled “Medeniyet Krizinde İkinci Perde” at Düşün Berlin. 
 

❖ Jury Membership 
 

• Prof. Melda ÜNER served as a jury member for an associate professorship evaluation at 



 

Adıyaman University (March 30). 
 

• Prof. Dr. Melda ÜNER served as a jury member for an associate professorship evaluation 
at Balıkesir University (March 30). 
 

• Prof. Dr. Melda ÜNER served as a jury member for an associate professorship evaluation 
at Bayburt University (March 30). 
 

• Prof. Dr. Melda ÜNER served as a jury member for an associate professorship evaluation 
at Siirt University (March 30). 


